

BAC

FDP Form 10c - Bid Results on Consulting Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.



**CONSULTING SERVICES BID-OUT**

**REGION:** REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON  
**PROVINCE:** BATAAN  
**CITY/MUNICIPALITY:**

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2023  
**QUARTER:** 2

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Location	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
1	CONSULTING SERVICES-SEF-002-2023	Geotechnical Investigation and Structural Design services for Various School within Bataan	Bataan	940,000.00	GIBA ENGINEERING SERVICES	Gilbert B. Magbutay Kalikasan St., Pasig City, Metro Manila	870,240.00	June 19, 2023	45 Calendar Days

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

  
AILEEN C. SAGUN  
OIC - BAC Secretariat

  
JEFFREY T. CALMA  
BAC Chairman

BAC

FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.



## CIVIL WORKS BID-OUT

REGION: REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON  
 PROVINCE: BATAAN  
 CITY/MUNICIPALITY:

CALENDAR YEAR: 2023  
 QUARTER: 2

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Approved Budget for Contract	Location	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
1	INFRA-20%DF-008-2023	Repair / Rehabilitation of Road Barangay Tabing - Ilog, Samal, Bataan	929,775.92	Barangay Tabing - Ilog, Samal, Bataan	CYPHRIAN BUILDERS AND TRADING	John Cyphrian M. Escudero Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	922,098.02	April 17, 2023	45 Calendar Days
2	INFRA-20%DF-006-2023	Improvement of Drainage System Barangay Cupang West, Balanga City, Bataan	1,949,919.37	Barangay Cupang West, Balanga City, Bataan	RCS CONSTRUCTION	Ramon C. Santos Yakal St., Panilao, Pilar, Bataan	1,935,898.26	April 25, 2023	45 Calendar Days
3	INFRA-20%DF-006-2023	Concreting of Road Barangay San Benito, Dinalupihan, Bataan	1,953,953.77	Barangay San Benito, Dinalupihan, Bataan	VICTORIA BUILDERS AND TRADING	Bryan G. Zabala Camia St., Venzon Subd., Cupang North, Balanga City, Bataan	1,946,896.12	April 25, 2023	60 Calendar days
4	INFRA-SEF - 004-2023	Construction of Drainage System Pandatung Elementary School Barangay Pandatung, Hermosa, Bataan	1,171,702.72	Barangay Pandatung, Hermosa, Bataan	R.Z. TIGAS CONSTRUCTION & TRADING	Rolando Z. Tigas Our Lady of Lourdes, Munting Batangas, Balanga City, Bataan	1,162,970.47	April 25, 2023	45 Calendar Days
5	INFRA-SEF - 005-2023	Rehabilitation/Improvement of School Facility Tucop Integrated School Barangay Tucop, Dinalupihan, Bataan	1,221,068.30	Barangay Tucop, Dinalupihan, Bataan	NICAP CONSTRUCTION	Romeo L. Caparaz GJ Caparaz St. Brgy. Central, Balanga City, Bataan	1,212,203.15	April 26, 2023	60 Calendar days
6	INFRA-20%DF-007-2023	Renovation of Health Center Barangay Tubo-Tubo, Dinalupihan, Bataan	1,541,184.25	Barangay Tubo-Tubo, Dinalupihan, Bataan	P & V CONSTRUCTION & SALES	Corazon Panganiban Sampaguita St., Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	1,528,603.38	April 26, 2023	45 Calendar Days

7	INFRA-20%DF-009-2023	Rehabilitation of Streetlights Barangay Mabini Proper, Dinalupihan, Bataan	1,950,599.07	Barangay Mabini Proper, Dinalupihan, Bataan	RWD CONSTRUCTION	Reynaldo W. Del Rosario Cuaderno Avenue Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	1,942,796.95	April 27, 2023	45 Calendar Days
8	INFRA-SEF - 006-2023	Construction of Two (2) Classroom School Building Pulo Integrated School Orani, Bataan	3,996,793.14	Orani, Bataan	E.R.VENZON CONSTRUCTION	Noli A. Venzon Sunflower St. Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	3,977,207.93	April 27, 2023	75 Calendar Days
9	INFRA-20%DF-010-2023	Concreting of Road Barangay Pinulot, Dinalupihan, Bataan	1,582,318.78	Barangay Pinulot, Dinalupihan, Bataan	ATP CONSTRUCTION	Alfredo T. Paguio Jr. Ma. Lourdes Subd., Balanga City, Bataan	1,565,425.76	April 27, 2023	60 Calendar days
10	INFRA-20%DF-009-2023	Construction of Multi-Purpose Hall Barangay Alion, Mariveles, Bataan	4,879,470.61	Barangay Alion, Mariveles, Bataan	VICTORIA BUILDERS AND TRADING	Bryan G. Zabala Camia St., Venzon Subd., Cupang North, Balanga City, Bataan	4,860,127.57	April 27, 2023	90 Calendar Days
11	INFRA-20%DF-012-2023	Construction of Farm to Market Road Barangay Paysawan, Bagac, Bataan	1,952,088.17	Barangay Paysawan, Bagac, Bataan	AJA BUILDERS	John R. Teopengco J. Linao Rd., Brgy. A. Ricardo, Bagac, Bataan	1,936,538.00	April 28, 2023	60 Calendar days
12	INFRA-20%DF-012-2023	Concreting of Road Barangay Pagalanggang, Dinalupihan, Bataan	1,952,502.17	Barangay Pagalanggang, Dinalupihan, Bataan	DM MADARANG CONSTRUCTION	Donald M. Madarang Josefaville, Pilar, Bataan	1,944,045.35	April 28, 2023	60 Calendar days
13	INFRA-20%DF-011-2023	Construction of Drainage System Barangay Kataasan, Dinalupihan, Bataan	1,953,058.84	Barangay Kataasan, Dinalupihan, Bataan	DM MADARANG CONSTRUCTION	Donald M. Madarang Josefaville, Pilar, Bataan	1,943,098.22	April 28, 2023	45 Calendar Days
14	INFRA-SEF - 008-2023	Construction of Two (2) Storey Six (6) Classroom School Building Bagac Elementary School, Bagac, Bataan	16,947,506.59	Bagac, Bataan	RCS CONSTRUCTION	Ramon C. Santos Yakal St., Panilao, Pilar, Bataan	16,922,383.73	May 8, 2023	180 Calendar Days
15	INFRA-SEF - 012-2023	Repair/Rehabilitation of Two (2) Classroom School Building Eva Aeta Elementary School Barangay Bilolo, Orion, Bataan	1,687,587.01	Barangay Bilolo, Orion, Bataan	NICAP CONSTRUCTION	Romeo L. Caparaz GJ Caparaz St. Brgy. Central, Balanga City, Bataan	1,676,721.52	May 8, 2023	45 Calendar Days



16	INFRA-SEF-009-2023	Construction of Two (2) Storey Four (4) Classroom School Building F.C. Del Rosario Integrated School Barangay Imelda, Samal, Bataan	12,423,362.69	Barangay Imelda, Samal, Bataan	R.Z. TIGAS CONSTRUCTION & TRADING	Rolando Z. Tigas Our Lady of Lourdes, Munting Batangas, Balanga City, Bataan	12,403,162.77	May 8, 2023	150 Calendar Days
17	INFRA-SEF-012-2023	Repair/Rehabilitation of Five (5) Classroom School Building Samal North Elementary School Barangay San Juan, Samal, Bataan	3,002,113.79	Barangay San Juan, Samal, Bataan	ARG Builders	Arnel R. Gozon San Jose, Balanga City, Bataan	2,988,899.44	May 8, 2023	60 Calendar days
18	INFRA-SEF-007-2023	Construction of Two (2) Storey Four (4) Classroom School Building Mabatang Elementary School Barangay Mabatang, Abucay, Bataan	12,433,647.61	Barangay Mabatang, Abucay, Bataan	R.Z. TIGAS CONSTRUCTION & TRADING	Rolando Z. Tigas Our Lady of Lourdes, Munting Batangas, Balanga City, Bataan	12,422,957.98	May 9, 2023	150 Calendar Days
19	INFRA-20%DF-013-2023	Concreting of Farm to Market Road Barangay Sibul, Orani, Bataan	4,886,755.05	Barangay Sibul, Orani, Bataan	ATP CONSTRUCTION	Alfredo T. Paguio Jr. Ma. Lourdes Subd., Balanga City, Bataan	4,830,515.47	May 9, 2023	60 Calendar days
20	INFRA-20%DF-013-2023	Construction of Multi-purpose Covered Court Barangay Saba, Hermosa, Bataan	7,600,100.87	Barangay Saba, Hermosa, Bataan	JMD DIAMOND CONSTRUCTION SERVICES	Jovy S. Dominguez Monte Carla Heights Tenejero, Balanga City, Bataan	7,590,472.00	May 9, 2023	90 Calendar Days
21	INFRA-20%DF-013-2023	Concreting of Road Barangay Dangcol, Balanga City, Bataan	4,882,637.61	Barangay Dangcol, Balanga City, Bataan	LEBERN BUILDERS TRADING & GEN. SERVICES	Bernardo D. Flores Jr. 13 Magolia St. Cupang North, Balanga City, Bataan	4,871,269.25	May 9, 2023	60 Calendar days
22	INFRA-GF-004-2023	Improvement of Drainage at BPSU Main Campus Balanga City, Bataan	4,872,473.96	Balanga City, Bataan	FAME BUILDER PHILIPPINES	Edilberto D. Pizarro 01 Gallardo St., Poblacion, Balanga City, Bataan	4,862,066.74	May 10, 2023	60 Calendar days
23	INFRA-20%DF-014-2023	Concreting of Road Barangay Laon, Abucay, Bataan	1,951,147.25	Barangay Laon, Abucay, Bataan	BPQ CONSTRUCTION & TRADING	Baron Vic P. Quezon Molave St., Balanga City, Bataan	1,941,965.87	May 10, 2023	45 Calendar Days

24	INFRA-SEF-011-2023	Construction of School Facility Calungusan ES Barangay Calungusan, Orion, Bataan	2,243,392.04	Barangay Calungusan, Orion, Bataan	LEBERN BUILDERS TRADING & GEN. SERVICES	Bernardo D. Flores Jr. 13 Magolia St. Cupang North, Balanga City, Bataan	2,228,559.56	May 10, 2023	60 Calendar days
25	INFRA-SEF-010-2023	Rehab/Improvement of Perimeter Fence Pandatung Elementary School Barangay Pandatung, Hermosa, Bataan	3,703,457.62	Barangay Pandatung, Hermosa, Bataan	YELLOW GOLD CONSTRUCTION	Dante R. Manalaysay Vicarville Subd., Bagong Silang, Balanga City, Bataan	3,563,836.59	May 10, 2023	60 Calendar days
26	INFRA-GF-005-2023	Construction of Two (2) Storey Health Center Barangay Doña, Orani, Bataan	4,874,483.62	Barangay Doña, Orani, Bataan	SUPREME BUILDERS CONSTRUCTION & TRADING	Hubert B. Pizarro EGSA 4 lanes, Brgy. Tuyo, Balanga City, Bataan	4,864,849.62	May 15, 2023	90 Calendar Days
27	INFRA-SEF-013-2023	Construction of Two (2) Storey Four (4) Classroom School Building Tubo-Tubo Elementary School Barangay Tubo-Tubo, Dinalupihan, Bataan	12,862,039.84	Barangay Tubo-Tubo, Dinalupihan, Bataan	R.Z. TIGAS CONSTRUCTION & TRADING	Rolando Z. Tigas Our Lady of Lourdes, Munting Batangas, Balanga City, Bataan	12,851,738.01	May 15, 2023	150 Calendar Days
28	INFRA-SEF-014-2023	Construction of Two (2) Storey Four (4) Classroom School Building Balsik Elementary School Barangay Balsik, Hermosa, Bataan	11,675,540.19	Barangay Balsik, Hermosa, Bataan	DAJ BUILDERS	Arsenio P. Flores Jr. Zamora St. Bagumbayan, Balanga City, Bataan	11,641,160.97	May 22, 2023	150 Calendar Days
29	INFRA-GF-007-2023	Construction of Guard House 1Bataan Command Center Barangay Doña, Orani, Bataan	1,857,396.87	Barangay Doña, Orani, Bataan	FIVE A CONSTRUCTION	Estelita Q. Batungbacal Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	1,813,284.81	May 22, 2023	45 Calendar Days
30	INFRA-GF-006-2023	Construction of Samal Municipal Building (Phase 3) Samal, Bataan	19,462,753.80	Samal, Bataan	JEK TRADING AND CONSTRUCTION	Crisante P. Ilaya Roman Superhighway Imelda, Samal, Bataan	19,452,279.35	May 22, 2023	90 Calendar Days
31	INFRA-20%DF-015-2023	Concreting of Road Barangay Luacan, Dinalupihan, Bataan	1,956,737.72	Barangay Luacan, Dinalupihan, Bataan	R.Z. TIGAS CONSTRUCTION & TRADING	Rolando Z. Tigas Our Lady of Lourdes, Munting Batangas, Balanga City, Bataan	1,940,734.24	May 22, 2023	60 Calendar days



32	INFRA-SEF-015-2023	Repair/Rehabilitation of Two (2) Classroom School Building Quinawan Elementary School Barangay Quinawan, Bagac, Bataan	1,541,635.34	Barangay Quinawan, Bagac, Bataan	ATP CONSTRUCTION	Alfredo T. Paguio Jr. Ma. Lourdes Subd., Balanga City, Bataan	1,531,131.67	May 23, 2023	45 Calendar Days
33	INFRA-GF-008-2023	Construction of Building Between Old Capitol Building and The Bunker (Phase 3) Capitol Compound, Balanga City, Bataan	10,697,494.88	Capitol Compound, Balanga City, Bataan	ITP CONSTRUCTION, INC.	Isidro M. Pajarillaga Jr. 10 Dao St. Project 3, Quezon City, Metro Manila	10,647,438.31	May 23, 2023	90 Calendar Days
34	INFRA-20%DF-016-2023	Construction of Irrigation Canal (Phase II) Barangay Bantan, Orion, Bataan	5,855,282.56	Barangay Bantan, Orion, Bataan	LEBERN BUILDERS TRADING & GEN. SERVICES	Bernardo D. Flores Jr. 13 Magolia St. Cupang North, Balanga City, Bataan	5,840,208.67	May 23, 2023	90 Calendar Days
35	INFRA-20%DF-017-2023	Concreting of Irrigation Canal in Palayan ng Bayan Barangay Pantingan, Pilar, Bataan	1,269,390.63	Barangay Pantingan, Pilar, Bataan	BQA CONSTRUCTION & TRADING	Allan Q. Batungbacal Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	1,257,687.41	May 24, 2023	45 Calendar Days
36	INFRA-20%DF-017-2023	Improvement of Road Barangay Parang, Bagac, Bataan	14,618,080.24	Barangay Parang, Bagac, Bataan	AJA BUILDERS	John R. Teopengco J. Linao Rd., Brgy. A. Ricardo, Bagac, Bataan	14,596,470.18	May 24, 2023	150 Calendar Days
37	INFRA-SEF-016-2023	Rehabilitation/Improvement of School Facility Dr. Victoria National High School Barangay Pantingan, Pilar, Bataan	2,048,205.17	Barangay Pantingan, Pilar, Bataan	AJA BUILDERS	John R. Teopengco J. Linao Rd., Brgy. A. Ricardo, Bagac, Bataan	2,038,849.34	May 24, 2023	60 Calendar days
38	INFRA-SEF-016-2023	Construction of Two (2) Storey Four (4) Classroom School Building Tapulao Elementary School Barangay Tapulao, Orani, Bataan	12,394,993.79	Barangay Tapulao, Orani, Bataan	RWD CONSTRUCTION	Reynaldo W. Del Rosario Cuaderno Avenue Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	12,385,550.03	May 24, 2023	150 Calendar Days
39	INFRA-20%DF-017-2023	Rehabilitation of Canal Barangay Balut I, Pilar, Bataan	1,950,677.73	Barangay Balut I, Pilar, Bataan	P & V CONSTRUCTION & SALES	Corazon Panganiban Sampaguita St., Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	1,940,156.47	May 24, 2023	45 Calendar Days
40	INFRA-20%DF-018-2023	Asphalting of Road (Phase II) Barangay Ma. Fe, Orani, Bataan	1,853,036.50	Barangay Ma. Fe, Orani, Bataan	4B CONSTRUCTION CORP.	Randy S. Viacrusis Subic, Zambales	1,850,008.98	May 25, 2023	10 Calendar Days

41	INFRA-TF-001-2023	Construction of Bataan Convention Center Provincial Capitol Compound, Balanga City, Bataan	96,499,983.20	Provincial Capitol Compound, Balanga City, Bataan	IPM CONSTRUCTION & DEVELOPMENT CORP.	Isabelita P. Mercado Penthouse The Taipan Place Condominium, E. Ortigas Jr. Road Ortigas Center, Pasig City, Metro Manila	96,494,651.98	May 29, 2023	180 Calendar Days
42	INFRA-GF-009-2023	Construction of Limay General Hospital, Limay, Bataan	97,229,780.42	Limay, Bataan	E.R.VENZON CONSTRUCTION	Noli A. Venzon Sunflower St. Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	97,059,283.09	May 30, 2023	240 Calendar Days
43	INFRA-SEF-017-2023	Repair/Rehabilitation of Home Economics and Canteen Mabatang Elementary School Barangay Mabatang, Abucay, Bataan	2,895,599.61	Barangay Mabatang, Abucay, Bataan	BPQ CONSTRUCTION & TRADING	Baron Vic P. Quezon Molave St., Balanga City, Bataan	2,875,002.43	May 30, 2023	60 Calendar days
44	INFRA-SEF-017-2023	Construction of Two (2) Storey Ten (10) Classroom School Building Ipag Elementary School Barangay Ipag, Mariveles, Bataan	28,233,627.41	Barangay Ipag, Mariveles, Bataan	POLYMER-VIC CONSTRUCTION / BPQ CONSTRUCTION & TRADING (JV)	Victor Quezon Doña Francisca Subd., Balanga City, Bataan	28,204,502.21	May 30, 2023	210 Calendar Days
45	INFRA-20%DF-019-2023	Drilling and Establishment of Electric Pump Irrigation System in Palayan ng Bayan Barangay Pantingan, Pilar, Bataan	2,145,666.14	Barangay Pantingan, Pilar, Bataan	RWD CONSTRUCTION	Reynaldo W. Del Rosario Cuaderno Avenue Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	2,133,980.29	May 30, 2023	60 Calendar days
46	INFRA-20%DF-020-2023	Riprapping of Perimeter Dikes and Construction of Open Canals in Provincial Tilapia Hatchery Barangay Pantingan, Pilar, Bataan	3,218,437.84	Barangay Pantingan, Pilar, Bataan	ATP CONSTRUCTION	Alfredo T. Paguio Jr. Ma. Lourdes Subd., Balanga City, Bataan	3,210,436.70	June 5, 2023	75 Calendar Days
47	INFRA-SEF-018-2023	Repair/Rehabilitation of Six (6) Classroom School Building Balut ES Barangay Balut, Pilar, Bataan	6,188,656.11	Barangay Balut, Pilar, Bataan	BPQ CONSTRUCTION & TRADING	Baron Vic P. Quezon Molave St., Balanga City, Bataan	6,167,948.60	June 5, 2023	90 Calendar Days
48	INFRA-SEF-019-2023	Construction of Four (4) Storey Twenty (20) Classroom School Building Morong National High School Barangay Sabang, Morong, Bataan	58,098,490.91	Barangay Sabang, Morong, Bataan	E.R.VENZON CONSTRUCTION	Noli A. Venzon Sunflower St. Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	58,069,133.59	June 13, 2023	300 Calendar Days


49	INFRA-20%DF-022-2023	Renovation of Old Laboratory at Bagac Community Medicare Hospital Bagac, Bataan	488,742.91	Bagac, Bataan	CYPHRIAN BUILDERS AND TRADING	John Cyphrian M. Escudero Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	479,443.46	June 13, 2023	30 Calendar Days
50	INFRA-5%LDRRM-001-2023	Construction of Dike Barangay Sapa, Samal, Bataan	4,876,455.84	Barangay Sapa, Samal, Bataan	RCS CONSTRUCTION	Ramon C. Santos Yakal St., Panilao, Pilar, Bataan	4,868,952.05	June 19, 2023	90 Calendar Days
51	INFRA-20%DF-021-2023	Improvement of Road Barangay Bagong Silang, Balanga City, Bataan	8,772,904.74	Barangay Bagong Silang, Balanga City, Bataan	YELLOW GOLD CONSTRUCTION	Dante R. Manalaysay Vicarville Subd., Bagong Silang, Balanga City, Bataan	8,762,351.74	June 19, 2023	90 Calendar Days
52	INFRA-20%DF-021-2023	Construction of Drainage System Barangay Kitang I, Limay, Bataan	4,873,384.60	Barangay Kitang I, Limay, Bataan	LEBERN BUILDERS TRADING & GEN. SERVICES	Bernardo D. Flores Jr. 13 Magolia St. Cupang North, Balanga City, Bataan	4,845,479.76	June 19, 2023	75 Calendar Days
53	INFRA-SEF-020-2023	Construction of Two (2) Storey Four (4) Classroom School Building Bangal Elementary School Barangay Bangal, Dinalupihan, Bataan	11,937,906.82	Barangay Bangal, Dinalupihan, Bataan	ATP CONSTRUCTION	Alfredo T. Paguio Jr. Ma. Lourdes Subd., Balanga City, Bataan	11,927,641.21	June 19, 2023	150 Calendar Days
54	INFRA-20%DF-023-2023	Construction of Water System Sitio Baclain Barangay Malaya, Mariveles, Bataan	2,925,390.66	Barangay Malaya, Mariveles, Bataan	MARVEL BUILDERS	John Paul M. Aquende T.Tiangco, Balanga City, Bataan	2,918,312.38	June 20, 2023	90 Calendar Days
55	INFRA-SEF-021-2023	Repair/Rehabilitation of Eight (8) Classroom School Building Kanawan Integrated School Morong, Bataan	3,557,690.36	Morong, Bataan	SUPREME BUILDERS CONSTRUCTION & TRADING	Hubert B. Pizarro EGSA 4 lanes, Brgy. Tuyoy, Balanga City, Bataan	3,549,902.61	June 20, 2023	75 Calendar Days
56	INFRA-20%DF-023-2023	Improvement of Road Baragay Tenejero, Balanga City, Bataan	3,418,299.00	Baragay Tenejero, Balanga City, Bataan	FIVE A CONSTRUCTION	Estelita Q. Batungbacal Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	3,373,900.02	June 20, 2023	75 Calendar Days
57	INFRA-20%DF-024-2023	Improvement of Multi-Purpose Building Barangay Camaya, Mariveles, Bataan	1,952,203.58	Barangay Camaya, Mariveles, Bataan	FAME BUILDER PHILIPPINES	Edilberto D. Pizarro 01 Gallardo St., Poblacion, Balanga City, Bataan	1,938,151.61	June 21, 2023	75 Calendar Days



58	INFRA-20%DF-024-2023	Rehabilitation & Improvement of Health Center Barangay Balut, Orion, Bataan	1,415,075.68	Barangay Balut, Orion, Bataan	RRF CONSTRUCTION	Rolando R. Flores J Escalada St. Pto. Rivas, Balanga City, Bataan	1,402,342.05	June 21, 2023	45 Calendar Days
59	INFRA-20%DF-024-2023	Rehabilitation of Road Barangay Zamora, Dinalupihan, Bataan	2,594,471.58	Barangay Zamora, Dinalupihan, Bataan	DAJ BUILDERS	Arsenio P. Flores Jr. Zamora St. Bagumbayan, Balanga City, Bataan	2,585,340.80	June 21, 2023	45 Calendar Days
60	INFRA-20%DF-024-2023	Improvement of Covered Court Barangay Daungan, Hermosa, Bataan	2,535,080.81	Barangay Daungan, Hermosa, Bataan	DELCO BUILDERS	Shaira Joy D. Balana Doña Maria, Balanga City, Bataan	2,514,118.97	June 21, 2023	45 Calendar Days
61	INFRA-20%DF-024-2023	Concreting of Road Barangay San Simon, Dinalupihan, Bataan	1,952,098.56	Barangay San Simon, Dinalupihan, Bataan	GR FEVIDAL CONSTRUCTION DEVELOPERS CORPORATION	Gerondio R. Fevidal 808 Dr. Jose Fabella St., Brgy. Plainview, Mandaluyong City, Metro Manila	1,935,786.14	June 21, 2023	60 Calendar days
62	INFRA-20%DF-025-2023	Rehabilitation/Improvement of Health Center Barangay Sto. Cristo, Hermosa, Bataan	1,951,582.86	Barangay Sto. Cristo, Hermosa, Bataan	NICAP CONSTRUCTION	Romeo L. Caparaz GJ Caparaz St. Brgy. Central, Balanga City, Bataan	1,936,736.87	June 29, 2023	60 Calendar days
63	INFRA-20%DF-025-2023	Construction of Multi-Purpose Building Barangay Daan Bago, Orion, Bataan	1,902,812.30	Barangay Daan Bago, Orion, Bataan	ATP CONSTRUCTION	Alfredo T. Paguio Jr. Ma. Lourdes Subd., Balanga City, Bataan	1,888,888.88	June 29, 2023	60 Calendar days

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

  
**AILEEN G. SAGUN**  
 OIC, BAC Secretariat

  
**JEFFREY T. GALMA**  
 BAC Chairman

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.



**GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT**

**REGION:** REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON  
**PROVINCE:** BATAAN  
**CITY/MUNICIPALITY:**

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2023  
**QUARTER:** 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
GOODS-SEF-003-2023	Lot 1: Fabrication, Supply and Delivery of Tables and Chairs (2-seaters) combination of steel and wood for distribution to Kindergarten in the Division of Bataan	15,516,000.00	BIGAY BUHAY MULTIPURPOSE COOPERATIVE	Alosee P. Bello Camia St., Caloocan City, Metro Manila	13,421,340.00	April 4, 2023
GOODS-SEF-003-2023	Lot 2: Fabrication, Supply and Delivery of Armchair (for right and left handed) combination of steel and hard plastic for distribution to Intermediate to Grade 6 in the Division of Bataan	38,308,000.00	DISTINCTIVE BLINDS & OFFICE SYSTEMS, INC.	Irene A. Ong 3361 Ramon Magsaysay Boulevard Brgy. 426, Zone 43, Samploc, Manila	37,220,052.80	April 4, 2023
GOODS-SEF-003-2023	Lot 3: Fabrication, Supply and Delivery of Tables and Chairs (2-seaters) combination of steel and wood for distribution to Grade 7 to Grade 12 in the Division of Bataan	31,350,000.00	GREGMAN'S GENERAL MERCHANDISE	Victorian H. Fernando 2119 Zamora St., San Roque, Tarlac City, Tarlac	29,469,000.00	April 4, 2023
GOODS-SEF-003-2023	Lot 4: Fabrication, Supply and Delivery of Teacher's Table and Chair for distribution to Kindergarten to Grade 12 in the Division of Bataan	8,508,000.00	ATLANTA INDUSTRIES INC.	Michael R. Asiddao 747 A. Mabini St., Manggahan, Pasig City, Metro Manila	7,657,200.00	April 4, 2023
GOODS-SEF-003-2023	Lot 5: Fabrication, Supply and Delivery of Blackboard for distribution of Kindergarten to Grade 12 in the Division of Bataan	6,316,800.00	BQA CONSTRUCTION & TRADING	Allan Q. Batungbacal Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	5,971,350.00	April 4, 2023

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

**GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT**

**REGION:** REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON  
**PROVINCE:** BATAAN  
**CITY/MUNICIPALITY:**

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2023  
**QUARTER:** 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
GOODS-20%DF-003-2023	Purchase of organic insecticide, grafted cacao, calamansi, rambutan, lanzones, avocado, Davao pomelo, mangostene, Bangkok santol and guyabano to be used in High Value Crop Development in Upland areas in Bataan	3,000,000.00	TR33 ENTERPRISE	May-An M. Umali 163 Balas Talisay, Batangas	2,945,870.00	April 11, 2023
GOODS-GF-009-2023	Purchase of Drugs and Medicines for the use of Orani District Hospital, Bataan	2,338,195.66	STERITEX MEDICAL SYSTEM	Cristin D. Sagum San Agustin, San Fernando City, Pampanga	2,337,115.60	April 11, 2023
GOODS-GF-011-2023	Purchase of Office Supplies for Stock Purposes, Bataan	1,295,753.00	JONIE ROSE TRADING	Marilyn Garote J.P. Rizal St., Poblacion, Balanga City, Bataan	1,275,579.45	April 17, 2023
GOODS-GF-012-2023	Purchase of Drugs and Medicine (Vials, Amp, Resp and Carp) Supplies for the use of Mariveles District Hospital, Bataan	4,448,040.10	CGMP MEDICAL DISTRIBUTORS	Milagros Kalong 51 San Miguel St. Cortijos De San Rafael Subd. San Rafael, Rodriguez, Rizal	3,421,868.10	April 24, 2023
GOODS-GF-010-2023	Purchase of Drugs and Medicine Supplies for the use of Mariveles District Hospital, Bataan	2,128,539.00	STERITEX MEDICAL SYSTEM	Cristin D. Sagum San Agustin, San Fernando City, Pampanga	1,620,525.09	April 24, 2023
GOODS-GF-014-2023	Security Services for Provincial Government of Bataan for the period covered from May 1, 2023 to September 30, 2023 & or 153 calendar days	21,168,128.60	KARPA II SECURITY SERVICES	Kristian James B. Paguio Roman Highway Tenejero, Balanga City, Bataan	21,161,275.90	April 24, 2023
GOODS-GF-015-2023	Security Services for Bataan General Hospital and Medical Center for the period covered from May 1, 2023 to July 31, 2023 & or 92 calendar days	4,832,499.12	ST. MORITZ SECURITY AGENCY, INC.	Teresita G. Lua Sto. Cristo Central, Balanga City, Bataan	4,832,499.12	April 24, 2023



FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

**GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT**

**REGION:** REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON  
**PROVINCE:** BATAAN  
**CITY/MUNICIPALITY:**

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2023  
**QUARTER:** 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
GOODS-GF-013-2023	Security Services for Capitol Compound for the period covered from May 1, 2023 to December 31, 2023 & or 245 calendar days	13,886,980.72	KARPA II SECURITY SERVICES	Kristian James B. Paguio Roman Highway Tenejero, Balanga City, Bataan	13,882,632.80	April 24, 2023
GOODS-SEF-004-2023	Security Services for Junior & Senior High School in DEPED Bataan for the period covered from May 1, 2023 to December 31, 2023 & or 245 calendar days	17,066,125.52	KARPA II SECURITY SERVICES	Kristian James B. Paguio Roman Highway Tenejero, Balanga City, Bataan	17,062,062.88	April 24, 2023
GOODS-TF-009-2023	Purchase of Service Vehicle will be use for the provision of rapid, efficient, social and emergency services in different barangays, Bataan	9,500,000.00	TOYOTA BATAAN INC.	Michael Angelo T. Tan Roman Superhighway Balanga City, Bataan	9,495,000.00	May 8, 2023
GOODS-20%DF-004-2023	Purchase of Agricultural Production and Postharvest Machineries and Equipment for different banner programs (Rice, Corn, High Value Crops and Organic) to be used of Qualified and validated Farmers Cooperatives and Associations/Organizations of Bataan	2,249,000.00	SM AGRI-MAC TRADING	Leonilo S. Malibiran Don M Banzon Ave., Balanga City, Bataan	2,245,880.00	May 23, 2023

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

**GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT**

**REGION:** REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON  
**PROVINCE:** BATAAN  
**CITY/MUNICIPALITY:**

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2023  
**QUARTER:** 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
GOODS-GF-016-2023	Purchase of Drugs and Medicines for the use of Jose C. Payumo Jr. Memorial Hospital, Bataan	4,633,327.15	STERITEX MEDICAL SYSTEM	Cristin D. Sagum San Agustin, San Fernando City, Pampanga	1,730,318.28	May 25, 2023
			QUAD-GEN PHARMACEUTICAL	Deo Vincent C. Encinares 4496 Gov Padilla St., Plaridel, Bulacan	766,546.95	
			PRE-AN'S ENTERPRISES	Irma C. Cruz Aquino St. corner Del Pilar St. Davsan Subdivision Sindalan, San Fernando City, Pampanga	418,540.00	
GOODS-5%LDRRM-001-2023	Purchase of Sports Utility Vehicles (Electric Vehicles) for the monitoring and implementation of plans, programs and projects of PDRRMO, Bataan	9,990,000.00	HANCARS, INC.	Webin Manzana 16 Scout Rallos St., Quezon City, Metro Manila	9,990,000.00	June 5, 2023
GOODS-20%DF-005-2023	Purchase of Engine for the Provision of Marine Diesel Engine to Small Scale Fishermen of Bataan	2,750,000.00	SM AGRI-MAC TRADING	Leonilo S. Malibiran Don M Banzon Ave., Balanga City, Bataan	2,744,500.00	June 5, 2023
GOODS-GF-019-2023	Purchase of survey equipment to be used for various Provincial Government of Bataan projects	1,900,000.00	TECPHIL GEOSOLUTIONS CO.	Maritess D. Enciso Door 7 Dizon Apartment Caritan Centro, Tuguegarao City, Cagayan	1,870,000.00	June 7, 2023
GOODS-20%DF-006-2023	Purchase of vegetable seeds and fertilizer for Development of High Value Crop Production in Bataan	1,499,950.00	FARVEST AGRIVET TRADING	Prince Cj V. Legaspi Curva Puncan, Carranglan, Nueva Ecija	1,415,000.00	June 7, 2023

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

**GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT**

**REGION:** REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON  
**PROVINCE:** BATAAN  
**CITY/MUNICIPALITY:**

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2023  
**QUARTER:** 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
GOODS-GF-018-2023	Purchase of Laboratory Supplies for the use of Mariveles District Hospital, Bataan	2,307,646.00	BERZAN ENTERPRISE	Andrea Jean Lucero 37 Capitol Drive San Jose, Balanga City, Bataan	404,260.00	June 7, 2023
			STERITEX MEDICAL SYSTEM	Cristin D. Sagum San Agustin, San Fernando City, Pampanga	26,378.40	
			EASYLIFE MEDICAL ENTERPRISE	Mary Ann V. Caverte G-164 Sitio Maligaya Culis, Hermosa, Bataan	3,485.00	
			PRE-AN'S ENTERPRISES	Irma C. Cruz Aquino St. corner Del Pilar St. Davsan Subdivision Sindalan, San Fernando City, Pampanga	645,140.50	
GOODS-GF-020-2023	Purchase of Medical Supplies for the use of Mariveles District Hospital, Bataan	1,292,185.00	EASYLIFE MEDICAL ENTERPRISE	Mary Ann V. Caverte G-164 Sitio Maligaya Culis, Hermosa, Bataan	4,720.00	June 7, 2023
			SANVEN MEDICAL ENTERPRISES INC.	Paul Wendell Pagdanganan Blk 22 Lot 10 Nevada St. Suburbia North Phase 2 Brgy. Malpitic, San Fernando City, Pampanga	215,891.25	
			STERITEX MEDICAL SYSTEM	Cristin D. Sagum San Agustin, San Fernando City, Pampanga	134,629.40	
			PRE-AN'S ENTERPRISES	Irma C. Cruz Aquino St. corner Del Pilar St. Davsan Subdivision Sindalan, San Fernando City, Pampanga	107,345.00	
			BERZAN ENTERPRISE	Andrea Jean Lucero 37 Capitol Drive San Jose, Balanga City, Bataan	81,564.00	



FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

**GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT**

**REGION:** REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON  
**PROVINCE:** BATAAN  
**CITY/MUNICIPALITY:**

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2023  
**QUARTER:** 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
GGODS-GF-022-2023	Purchase of Metal Guardrails to be installed along Provincial Roads for Road Safety at Salian Vicinal Road, Orani Tala-Sibul Road, Sacrifice Valley Hermosa, Tama-Katwiran Hermosa and Maluang-Dangcol Road, Bataan	959,376.00	ARBAT TRADING	Arnold Q. Batungbacal Cuaderno Avenue Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	949,410.00	June 26, 2023
GOODS-GF-020-2023	Purchase of Medicines to be use for Bagac Community and Medicare Hospital, Bataan	1,074,773.74	EASYLIFE MEDICAL ENTERPRISE	Mary Ann V. Caverte G-164 Sitio Maligaya Culis, Hermosa, Bataan	37,749.50	June 29, 2023
			SANVEN MEDICAL ENTERPRISES INC.	Paul Wendell Pagdanganan Blk 22 Lot 10 Nevada St. Suburbia North Phase 2 Brgy. Malpitic, San Fernando City, Pampanga	16,566.94	
			STERITEX MEDICAL SYSTEM	Cristin D. Sagum San Agustin, San Fernando City, Pampanga	71,491.47	
			QUAD-GEN PHARMACEUTICAL	Deo Vincent C. Encinares 4496 Gov Padilla St., Plaridel, Bulacan	99,608.96	
			BERZAN ENTERPRISE	Andrea Jean Lucero 37 Capitol Drive San Jose, Balanga City, Bataan	237,352.20	

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

  
**AILEEN M. SAGUN**  
 OIC - BAC Secretariat

  
**JEFFREY T. CALMA**  
 BAC Chairman