

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

**GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT**

**REGION:** REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2023

**PROVINCE:** BATAAN

**QUARTER:** 2

**CITY/MUNICIPALITY:**

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
GOODS-SEF-003-2023	Lot 1: Fabrication, Supply and Delivery of Tables and Chairs (2-seaters) combination of steel and wood for distribution to Kindergarten in the Division of Bataan	15,516,000.00	BIGAY BUHAY MULTIPURPOSE COOPERATIVE	Alose P. Bello Camia St., Caloocan City, Metro Manila	13,421,340.00	April 4, 2023
GOODS-SEF-003-2023	Lot 2: Fabrication, Supply and Delivery of Armchair (for right and left handed) combination of steel and hard plastic for distribution to Intermediate to Grade 6 in the Division of Bataan	38,308,000.00	DISTINCTIVE BLINDS & OFFICE SYSTEMS, INC.	Irene A. Ong 3361 Ramon Magsaysay Boulevard Brgy. 426, Zone 43, Samploc, Manila	37,220,052.80	April 4, 2023
GOODS-SEF-003-2023	Lot 3: Fabrication, Supply and Delivery of Tables and Chairs (2 seaters) combination of steel and wood for distribution to Grade 7 to Grade 12 in the Division of Bataan	31,350,000.00	GREGMAN'S GENERAL MERCHANDISE	Victorian H. Fernando 2119 Zamora St., San Roque, Tarlac City, Tarlac	29,469,000.00	April 4, 2023
GOODS-SEF-003-2023	Lot 4: Fabrication, Supply and Delivery of Teacher's Table and Chair for distribution to Kindergarten to Grade 12 in the Division of Bataan	8,508,000.00	ATLANTA INDUSTRIES INC.	Michael R. Asiddao 747 A. Mabini St., Manggahan, Pasig City, Metro Manila	7,657,200.00	April 4, 2023

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

**GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT**

**REGION:** REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2023

**PROVINCE:** BATAAN

**QUARTER:** 2

**CITY/MUNICIPALITY:**

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
GOODS-SEF-003-2023	Lot 5: Fabrication, Supply and Delivery of Blackboard for distribution of Kindergarten to Grade 12 in the Division of Bataan	6,316,800.00	BQA CONSTRUCTION & TRADING	Allan Q. Batungbacal Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	5,971,350.00	April 4, 2023
GOODS-20%DF-003-2023	Purchase of organic insecticide, grafted cacao, calamansi, rambutan, lanzones, avocado, Davao pomelo, mangostene, Bangkok santol and guyabano to be used in High Value Crop Development in Upland areas in Bataan	3,000,000.00	TR33 ENTERPRISE	May-An M. Umali 163 Balas Talisay, Batangas	2,945,870.00	April 11, 2023
GOODS-GF-009-2023	Purchase of Drugs and Medicines for the use of Orani District Hospital, Bataan	2,338,195.66	STERITEX MEDICAL SYSTEM	Cristin D. Sagum San Agustin, San Fernando City, Pampanga	2,337,115.60	April 11, 2023
GOODS-GF-011-2023	Purchase of Office Supplies for Stock Purposes, Bataan	1,295,753.00	JONIE ROSE TRADING	Marilyn Garote J.P. Rizal St., Poblacion, Balanga City, Bataan	1,275,579.45	April 17, 2023
GOODS-GF-012-2023	Purchase of Drugs and Medicine (Vials, Amp, Resp and Carp) Supplies for the use of Mariveles District Hospital, Bataan	4,448,040.10	CGMP MEDICAL DISTRIBUTORS	Milagros Kalong 51 San Miguel St. Cortijos De San Rafael Subd. San Rafael, Rodriguez, Rizal	3,421,868.10	April 24, 2023

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

**GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT**

**REGION:** REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2023

**PROVINCE:** BATAAN

**QUARTER:** 2

**CITY/MUNICIPALITY:**

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
GOODS-GF-010-2023	Purchase of Drugs and Medicine Supplies for the use of Mariveles District Hospital, Bataan	2,128,539.00	STERITEX MEDICAL SYSTEM	Cristin D. Sagum San Agustin, San Fernando City, Pampanga	1,620,525.09	April 24, 2023
GOODS-GF-014-2023	Security Services for Provincial Government of Bataan for the period covered from May 1, 2023 to September 30, 2023 & or 153 calendar days	21,168,128.60	KARPA II SECURITY SERVICES	Kristian James B. Paguio Roman Highway Tenejero, Balanga City, Bataan	21,161,275.90	April 24, 2023
GOODS-GF-015-2023	Security Services for Bataan General Hospital and Medical Center for the period covered from May 1, 2023 to July 31, 2023 & or 92 calendar days	4,832,499.12	ST. MORITZ SECURITY AGENCY, INC.	Teresita G. Lua Sto. Cristo Central, Balanga City, Bataan	4,832,499.12	April 24, 2023
GOODS-GF-013-2023	Security Services for Capitol Compound for the period covered from May 1, 2023 to December 31, 2023 & or 245 calendar days	13,886,980.72	KARPA II SECURITY SERVICES	Kristian James B. Paguio Roman Highway Tenejero, Balanga City, Bataan	13,882,632.80	April 24, 2023
GOODS-SEF-004-2023	Security Services for Junior & Senior High School in DEPED Bataan for the period covered from May 1, 2023 to December 31, 2023 & or 245 calendar days	17,066,125.52	KARPA II SECURITY SERVICES	Kristian James B. Paguio Roman Highway Tenejero, Balanga City, Bataan	17,062,062.88	April 24, 2023

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

**GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT**

**REGION:** REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2023

**PROVINCE:** BATAAN

**QUARTER:** 2

**CITY/MUNICIPALITY:**

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
GOODS-TF-009-2023	Purchase of Service Vehicle will be use for the provision of rapid, efficient, social and emergency services in different barangays, Bataan	9,500,000.00	TOYOTA BATAAN INC.	Michael Angelo T. Tan Roman Superhighway Balanga City, Bataan	9,495,000.00	May 8, 2023
GOODS-20%DF-004-2023	Purchase of Agricultural Production and Postharvest Machineries and Equipment for different banner programs (Rice, Corn, High Value Crops and Organic) to be used of Qualified and validated Farmers Cooperatives and Associations/Organizations of Bataan	2,249,000.00	SM AGRI-MAC TRADING	Leonilo S. Malibiran Don M Banzon Ave., Balanga City, Bataan	2,245,880.00	May 23, 2023
GOODS-GF-016-2023	Purchase of Drugs and Medicines for the use of Jose C. Payumo Jr.	4,633,327.15	STERITEX MEDICAL SYSTEM	Cristin D. Sagum San Agustin, San Fernando City, Pampanga	1,730,318.28	May 25, 2023
			QUAD-GEN PHARMACEUTICAL	Deo Vincent C. Encinares 4496 Gov Padilla St., Plaridel, Bulacan	766,546.95	

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

**GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT**

**REGION:** REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2023

**PROVINCE:** BATAAN

**QUARTER:** 2

**CITY/MUNICIPALITY:**

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
2023	Memorial Hospital, Bataan		PRE-AN'S ENTERPRISES	Irma C. Cruz Aquino St. corner Del Pilar St. Davsan Subdivision Sindalan, San Fernando City, Pampanga	418,540.00	
GOODS-5%LDRRM-001-2023	Purchase of Sports Utility Vehicles (Electric Vehicles) for the monitoring and implementation of plans, programs and projects of PDRRMO, Bataan	9,990,000.00	HANCARS, INC.	Webin Manzana 16 Scout Rallos St., Quezon City, Metro Manila	9,990,000.00	June 5, 2023
GOODS-20%DF-005-2023	Purchase of Engine for the Provision of Marine Diesel Engine to Small Scale Fishermen of Bataan	2,750,000.00	SM AGRI-MAC TRADING	Leonilo S. Malibiran Don M Banzon Ave., Balanga City, Bataan	2,744,500.00	June 5, 2023
GOODS-GF-019-2023	Purchase of survey equipment to be used for various Provincial Government of Bataan projects	1,900,000.00	TECPHIL GEOSOLUTIONS CO.	Maritess D. Enciso Door 7 Dizon Apartment Caritan Centro, Tuguegarao City, Cagayan	1,870,000.00	June 7, 2023
GOODS-20%DF-006-2023	Purchase of vegetable seeds and fertilizer for Development of High Value Crop Production in Bataan	1,499,950.00	FARVEST AGRIVET TRADING	Prince Cj V. Legaspi Curva Puncan, Carranglan, Nueva Ecija	1,415,000.00	June 7, 2023
			BERZAN ENTERPRISE	Andrea Jean Lucero 37 Capitol Drive San Jose, Balanga City, Bataan	404,260.00	

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

**GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT**

**REGION:** REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2023

**PROVINCE:** BATAAN

**QUARTER:** 2

**CITY/MUNICIPALITY:**

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
GOODS-GF-018-2023	Purchase of Laboratory Supplies for the use of Mariveles District Hospital, Bataan	2,307,646.00	STERITEX MEDICAL SYSTEM	Cristin D. Sagum San Agustin, San Fernando City, Pampanga	26,378.40	June 7, 2023
			EASYLIFE MEDICAL ENTERPRISE	Mary Ann V. Caverte G-164 Sitio Maligaya Culis, Hermosa, Bataan	3,485.00	
			PRE-AN'S ENTERPRISES	Irma C. Cruz Aquino St. corner Del Pilar St. Davsan Subdivision Sindalan, San Fernando City, Pampanga	645,140.50	
GOODS-GF-020-2023	Purchase of Medical Supplies for the use of Mariveles District Hospital, Bataan	1,292,185.00	EASYLIFE MEDICAL ENTERPRISE	Mary Ann V. Caverte G-164 Sitio Maligaya Culis, Hermosa, Bataan	4,720.00	June 7, 2023
			SANVEN MEDICAL ENTERPRISES INC.	Paul Wendell Pagdanganan Blk 22 Lot 10 Nevada St. Suburbia North Phase 2 Brgy. Malpitic, San Fernando City, Pampanga	215,891.25	
			STERITEX MEDICAL SYSTEM	Cristin D. Sagum San Agustin, San Fernando City, Pampanga	134,629.40	

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

**GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT**

**REGION:** REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON  
**PROVINCE:** BATAAN  
**CITY/MUNICIPALITY:**

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2023  
**QUARTER:** 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
			PRE-AN'S ENTERPRISES	Irma C. Cruz Aquino St. corner Del Pilar St. Davsan Subdivision Sindalan, San Fernando City, Pampanga	107,345.00	
			BERZAN ENTERPRISE	Andrea Jean Lucero 37 Capitol Drive San Jose, Balanga City, Bataan	81,564.00	
GGODS-GF-022-2023	Purchase of Metal Guardrails to be installed along Provincial Roads for Road Safety at Salian Vicinal Road, Orani Tala-Sibul Road, Sacrifice Valley Hermosa, Tama-Katwiran Hermosa and Maluang-Dangcol Road, Bataan	959,376.00	ARBAT TRADING	Arnold Q. Batungbacal Cuaderno Avenue Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	949,410.00	June 26, 2023
			EASYLIFE MEDICAL ENTERPRISE	Mary Ann V. Caverte G-164 Sitio Maligaya Culis, Hermosa, Bataan	37,749.50	
GOODS-GF-020	Purchase of Medicines to be use for		SANVEN MEDICAL ENTERPRISES INC.	Paul Wendell Pagdanganan Blk 22 Lot 10 Nevada St. Suburbia North Phase 2 Brgy. Malpitic, San Fernando City, Pampanga	16,566.94	

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

**GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT**

**REGION:** REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON  
**PROVINCE:** BATAAN  
**CITY/MUNICIPALITY:**

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2023  
**QUARTER:** 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
GOODS AND SERVICES 2023	Bagac Community and Medicare Hospital, Bataan	1,074,773.74	STERITEX MEDICAL SYSTEM	Cristin D. Sagum San Agustin, San Fernando City, Pampanga	71,491.47	June 29, 2023
			QUAD-GEN PHARMACEUTICAL	Deo Vincent C. Encinares 4496 Gov Padilla St., Plaridel, Bulacan	99,608.96	
			BERZAN ENTERPRISE	Andrea Jean Lucero 37 Capitol Drive San Jose, Balanga City, Bataan	237,352.20	

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

**AILEEN C. SAGUN**  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 OIC - BAC Secretariat

**JEFFREY T. CALMA**  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 BAC Chairman



FDP Form 10c - Bid Results on Consulting Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

**CONSULTING SERVICES BID-OUT**

**REGION:** REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2023

**PROVINCE:** BATAAN

**QUARTER:** 2

**CITY/MUNICIPALITY:**

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Location	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
1	CONSULTING SERVICES-SEF-002-2023	Geotechnical Investigation and Structural Design services for Various School within Bataan	Bataan	940,000.00	GIBA ENGINEERING SERVICES	Gilbert B. Magbutay Kalikasan St., Pasig City, Metro Manila	870,240.00	June 19, 2023	45 Calendar Days

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

AILEEN C. SAGUN  
OIC - BAC Secretariat

JEFFREY T. CALMA  
BAC Chairman