

BAC

FDP Form 10c - Bid Results on Consulting Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

CONSULTING SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON
PROVINCE: BATAAN
CITY/MUNICIPALITY:

CALENDAR YEAR: 2023
QUARTER: 4

| No. | Reference No. | Name of Project | Location | Approved Budget for Contract | Winning Bidder | Name and Address | Bid Amount | Bidding Date | Contract Duration |
|-----|---------------|-----------------------------------|----------|------------------------------|----------------|------------------|------------|--------------|-------------------|
| | | NO BIDDED PROJECT FOR THE QUARTER | | | | | | | |

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.


AILEEN C. SAGUN
BAC Secretariat


JEFFREY T. CALMA
BAC Chairman



BAC

FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

CIVIL WORKS BID-OUT

REGION: REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON
 PROVINCE: BATAAN
 CITY/MUNICIPALITY:

CALENDAR YEAR: 2023
 QUARTER: 4

| No. | Reference No. | Name of Project | Approved Budget for Contract | Location | Winning Bidder | Name and Address | Bid Amount | Bidding Date | Contract Duration |
|-----|----------------------|---|------------------------------|---|-----------------------------------|---|---------------|-------------------|-------------------|
| 1 | INFRA-20%DF-039-2023 | Rehabilitation / Improvement of Covered Court Barangay Pag-asa, Bagac, Bataan | 4,854,627.46 | Barangay Pag-asa, Bagac, Bataan | ARG BUILDERS & TRADING | Arnel R. Gozon San Jose, Balanga City, Bataan | 4,848,666.92 | October 16, 2023 | 90 Calendar Days |
| 2 | INFRA-20%DF-042-2023 | Rehabilitation of Bataan-Philippines Red Cross Blood Collecting Facility Capitol Compound, Balanga City, Bataan | 828,755.66 | Capitol Compound, Balanga City, Bataan | DELCO BUILDERS | Shaira Joy D. Balana Doña Maria, Balanga City, Bataan | 817,985.51 | November 17, 2023 | 30 Calendar Days |
| 3 | INFRA-20%DF-040-2023 | Concreting of Farm to Market Road Barangay Imelda, Samal, Bataan | 7,799,083.13 | Barangay Imelda, Samal, Bataan | ATP CONSTRUCTION | Alfredo T. Paguio Jr. Ma. Lourdes Subd., Balanga City, Bataan | 7,784,387.98 | November 17, 2023 | 60 Calendar Days |
| 4 | INFRA-20%DF-041-2023 | Construction of Sports Training Facilities Barangay Tenejero, Balanga City, Bataan | 8,757,969.69 | Barangay Tenejero, Balanga City, Bataan | RWD CONSTRUCTION | Reynaldo W. Del Rosario Cuaderno Avenue Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan | 8,747,820.28 | December 4, 2023 | 60 Calendar Days |
| 5 | INFRA-GF-011-2023 | Construction of Perimeter Fence 1Bataan Village Mariveles Heights | 11,681,136.29 | Mariveles, Bataan | R.Z. TIGAS CONSTRUCTION & TRADING | Rolando Z. Tigas Our Lady of Lourdes, Munting Batangas, Balanga City, Bataan | 11,669,088.00 | December 11, 2023 | 90 Calendar Days |

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.


 AILEEN Y. SAGUN
 BAC Secretariat


 JEFFREY T. CALMA
 BAC Chairman



BAC

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.



GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON
PROVINCE: BATAAN
CITY/MUNICIPALITY:

CALENDAR YEAR: 2023
QUARTER: 4

| Reference No. | Item Description | Approved Budget for Contract | Winning Bidder | Name and Address of Bidder | Bid Amount | Date of Bidding |
|----------------------|---|------------------------------|-------------------------------------|--|---------------|------------------|
| GOODS-GF-030-2023 | Purchase of Portable Active Speaker System to be distributed to 237 Barangays in Bataan for the Support in Barangay Information Dissemination | 2,998,050.00 | TRICAM CONSTRUCTION AND TRADING | Bebeilene E. Camus Cupang Proper, Balanga City, Bataan | 2,962,500.00 | August 14, 2023 |
| GOODS-20%DF-011-2023 | Purchase of Garbage Truck for PGB Solid Waste Management | 3,500,000.00 | KINGLING ISUZU PHILIPPINES INC. | William Uy 788 A. Bonifacio Avenue Brgy. Pag ibig sa Nayon Quezon City | 3,495,000.00 | October 9, 2023 |
| GOODS-GF-037-2023 | Purchase of Dialysis Supplies for the use of Jose C Payumo Jr. Memorial Hsopital Dinalupihan, Bataan | 1,109,440.00 | FRESENIUS MEDICAL CARE PHILS., INC. | Daisy Jennifer Galang / Ryan Tanguilig 18th floor AEON Centre, Alabang Zapote Rd., Cor. Northgate, Filinvest Alabang, Muntinlupa City, Metro Manila | 627,990.00 | October 16, 2023 |
| | | | STA. ANA ENTERPRISES | Rod Raven D. Dia Lot 3200-A Sitio Banlic Brgy. Cabalantian, Bacolor, Pampanga | 155,800.00 | |
| GOODS-20%DF-012-2023 | Supply, Delivery & Installation of VRF type airconditioning units including feederline and ducting system at the Bataan People's Center, Capitol Compound, Balanga City, Bataan | 11,234,409.00 | MECH-AIR SYSTEMS CORPORATION | Michael E. Cruz Lot 1-C-8 Francisco Homes Phase D Francisco Homes - Mulawin, San Jose Del Monte City, Bulacan | 11,229,206.00 | October 17, 2023 |

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a - CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON

CALENDAR YEAR: 2023

PROVINCE: BATAAN

QUARTER: 4

CITY/MUNICIPALITY:

| Reference No. | Item Description | Approved Budget for Contract | Winning Bidder | Name and Address of Bidder | Bid Amount | Date of Bidding |
|----------------------|--|------------------------------|---|--|----------------|-------------------|
| GOODS-GF-036-2023 | Purchase of Drugs and Medicines for the use of Jose C. Payumo Jr. Memorial Hospital, Bataan | 2,952,498.30 | STERITEX MEDICAL SYSTEM | Cristin D. Sagum San Agustin, San Fernando City, Bataan | 1,366,881.75 | October 17, 2023 |
| | | | QUAD-GEN PHARMACEUTICAL | Deo Vincent C. Encinares 4496 Gov Padilla St., Plaridel, Bulacan | 544,412.25 | |
| | | | CGMP MEDICAL DISTRIBUTORS | Jean Jennifer Estonedo San Miguel Drive, Rodriguez, Rizal | 225,167.00 | |
| GOODS-20%DF-013-2023 | Purchase of Medical and Laboratory Equipment for the use of Jose C. Payumo Jr. Memorial Hospital, Dinalupihan, Bataan | 2,000,000.00 | PRE-AN'S ENTERPRISES | Ofreciana Sanchez Aquino St. corner Del Pilar Street Davsan Subdivision Sindalan, San Fernando City, Pampanga | 1,683,000.00 | October 24, 2023 |
| | | | BERZAN ENTERPRISE | Glyzel Bermejo 37 Capitol Drive San Jose, Balanga City, Bataan | 219,500.00 | |
| GOODS-GF-038-2023 | Supply, Delivery & Distribution of Goods for Bataan constituents as Tulong Mula sa Pamahalaan | 77,675,000.00 | ELIZABETH BAKERY & GROCERY | Bernardino V. Gaza 10 Arellano, Orion, Bataan | 72,492,500.00 | November 6, 2023 |
| GOODS-GF-039-2023 | Purchase of Drugs and Medicine (Vials, Amp, Resp and Carp) Supplies for the use of Mariveles District Hospital, Bataan | 1,756,574.40 | STERITEX MEDICAL SYSTEM | Cristin D. Sagum San Agustin, San Fernando City, Bataan | 478,719.70 | November 7, 2023 |
| | | | QUAD-GEN PHARMACEUTICAL | Deo Vincent C. Encinares 4496 Gov Padilla St., Plaridel, Bulacan | 358,395.00 | |
| GOODS-SEF-007-2023 | Procurement of ICT Equipments for Public School Teachers of Junior and Senior High School in the Province of Bataan | 124,975,000.00 | POWER MAC CENTER, INC. | Unit 408 and 436 Cyberzone SM Megamall Bldg B Edsa Wack Wack Mandaluyong City, Metro Manila | 119,500,000.00 | November 17, 2023 |
| GOODS-SEF-009-2023 | Procurement of Sports Equipments for the Division of Bataan | 3,663,275.00 | APOLLO MERCHANDISE AND LIGHTS AND SOUNDS SYSTEM | Juanito B. De Leon 164 Hyperion St., Apollo, Orani, Bataan | 3,662,945.00 | December 4, 2023 |

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON
PROVINCE: BATAAN
CITY/MUNICIPALITY:

CALENDAR YEAR: 2023
QUARTER: 4

| Reference No. | Item Description | Approved Budget for Contract | Winning Bidder | Name and Address of Bidder | Bid Amount | Date of Bidding |
|------------------------|---|------------------------------|---|--|---------------|-------------------|
| GOODS-SEF-009-2023 | Procurement of Sports Supplies for the Division of Bataan | 11,054,571.96 | APOLLO MERCHANDISE AND LIGHTS AND SOUNDS SYSTEM | Juanito B. De Leon 164 Hyperion St., Apollo, Orani, Bataan | 11,051,346.00 | December 4, 2023 |
| GOODS-TF-011-2023 | Purchase of ICT Equipment in support to operations on Local Health Systems to province-wide and city-wide health system and PHO-MIS | 1,095,983.00 | ALMARK GADGET COMPUTER SALES & SERVICES | Maricris B. Quintos Capitol Drive, San Jose, Balanga City, Bataan | 986,999.95 | December 5, 2023 |
| GOODS-SEF-010-2023 | Purchase of IT Equipment for the use of Bataan High School for the Arts | 1,480,000.00 | ALMARK GADGET COMPUTER SALES & SERVICES | Maricris B. Quintos Capitol Drive, San Jose, Balanga City, Bataan | 1,296,998.50 | December 5, 2023 |
| GOODS-TF-012-2023 | Purchase of Sport Utility Vehicles (Electric Vehicles) for mobility purposes and immediate during disaster and calamities. Bataan | 9,999,000.00 | HANCARS INC. | Webin Manzana 16 Scout Rallos St., Quezon City, Metro Manila | 9,990,000.00 | December 11, 2023 |
| GOODS-SEF-011-2023 | Procurement for the subscription to a remote communication platform for the distribution and retrieval of digital content and learning materials for the learners of DepEd Division of Bataan | 7,868,927.00 | XEPTO COMPUTING INC. | Erwin C. Saguinsin Unit 2022, 22nd floor Asian Star Bldg FCC Alabang, Muntinlupa City, Metro Manila | 7,800,000.00 | December 19, 2023 |
| GOODS-5%LDRRM-004-2023 | Procurement of Rescue Drone to be used for disaster Rescue Operations. Bataan | 2,500,000.00 | KREATIVE I.T. SOLUTIONS | Khristine A. Camacho Paroba St., Brgy. East Calaguiman, Samal, Bataan | 2,390,000.00 | December 27, 2023 |

Note: August 14, 2023 bidding was not included in 3rd Quarter due to finalization in Post-Qualification

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.


AMELITO C. SAGUIN
 BAC Secretariat


JEFFREY T. CALMA
 BAC Chairman